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Briscoe, Christina A (HSS)

From: Haven Harris [hharris@nshcorp.org]
Sent: Tuesday, July 29, 2008 11:09 AM
To: Briscoe, Christina A (HSS)
Subject: RE: Problems with Denali Grant

Attachments: ATT487161.txt

Yes, the community has confirmed they have the funds. What we are working with them to achieve is find out if there are any third
party groups that can assist them in providing other matching dollars. Christina, | will be submitting a request for

reimbursment before August 15.

Haven

From: Briscoe, Christina A (HSS) [mailto:christina.briscoe@alaska.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, July 29, 2008 9:06 AM

To: Haven Harris

Subject: RE: Problems with Denali Grant

Importance: High

Haven,

So what you are telling me is the matching funds have been confirmed, and you are just reminding them of their commitment at this
point?

Chris Briscoe

Accountant ll/Acting Grant Administrator
Department of Health and Social Services
Finance and Management Services
Facilities Section

(907) 465-1873

(907) 465-2027 (fax)

From: Haven Harris [mailto:hharris@nshcorp.org]
Sent: Thursday, July 24, 2008 3:27 PM

To: Briscoe, Christina A (HSS)

Cc: OwlKennel@aol.com; Frawley, Michael V (HSS)
Subject: RE: Problems with Denali Grant

Christine,

In the requests the communities all stated that they would be able to get the matching funds required for each project. What we are
doing now is working with the communities to make sure they have these funds before we start expending funds. For example, the
Community (City, Tribe, and Native Corp) of Gambell, has agreed to provide the funds needed, but they are also working with
external organizations to see if they can procure other funds. That is what | was trying to express in my report.

Haven

From: Briscoe, Christina A (HSS) [mailto:christina.briscoe@alaska.gov]
Sent: Thursday, July 24, 2008 3:00 PM

To: Haven Harris

Cc: OwlKennel@aol.com; Frawley, Michael V (HSS)

Subject: RE: Problems with Denali Grant

Importance: High

According to your last progress report on Denali Commission funds:

“| am waiting to hear from communities about their abilities to provide the matching funds that they stated were available.”

7/29/2008
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The powers that be at the Denali Commission were under the impression these matching funds were secured (i.e., the communities
had already set these funds aside to be used for this project) prior to you being approved for these grant funds. Can you please
provide some clarification on this issue?

Thank You!

Chris Briscoe

Accountant ll/Acting Grant Administrator
Department of Health and Social Services
Finance and Management Services
Facilities Section

(907) 465-1873

(907) 465-2027 (fax)

From: Haven Harris [mailto:hharris@nshcorp.org]
Sent: Thursday, July 24, 2008 2:52 PM

To: Briscoe, Christina A (HSS)

Cc: OwlKennel@aol.com

Subject: Problems with Denali Grant

Christine,

What problems do we still have, is NSHC/me causing you grief??? Sorry if | am. When does the Denali Commission money have
to spent? | have some bills that | can put towards those funds right now if it would be appropriate.

Haven

7/29/2008



